Special Diet Foods for Dec 1, 2009 through
January 14, 2010

MFG Name
Description QTY Unit and Number Karetas
PUREED SOUFFLES
Cliffdale
Apple Cinnamon French Toast, Frozen, 4/4 |b. Farms
1 pans/case 3 case #37158 54.14
or approved equal
Cliffdale
Farms
2|Banana French Toast, Frozen, 4/4 |b pans/case 3 case |#33795 54.14
or approved equal
Cliffdale
Farms
3 Beef BBQ Sauce, Cooked Frozen, 4/4 Ib pans/case 2 case |#44585 62.73
or approved equal
Cliffdale
Farms
4 Beef & Vegetables, Cooked, Frozen, 4/4 Ib.pans/case 3 case |#31924 62.73
or approved equal
Cliffdale
5 Beef & Chili, Cooked, Frozen 4/4 Ib. pans/case 0 case |Farms no bid
or approved equal
Cliffdale
Farms
6 Beef Lasagna, Partly Baked, Frozen 4/4 |b.pans/cs 4 case |#35683 62.73
or approved equal
Cliffdale
Farms
7|Cheese Pizza, Cooked, Frozen, 4/4 |b pans/case 1 case |#20517 62.73
or approved equal
Cliffdale
Farms
8 Chicken La Orange, Cooked, frozen, 4/4 Ib. pans/case 3 case |#44920 62.73
or approved equal
Cliffdale
Farms
9 Peach French Toast, Frozen, 4/4 Ib pans/case 3 case |#19650 54.14
or approved equal
Cliffdale
Roast Beef & Cheddar, Cooked, Frozen, 4/4 1b Farms
10 pans/case 4 case |#41447 62.73
or approved equal
Cliffdale
Farms
11 Tuna Cheddar, Cooked, Frozen 4/4 Ib. pans/case 3 case (#43911 62.73

or approved equal




MFG Name

Description QTY Unit and Number Karetas
PUREED SOUFFLES
Cliffdale
Farms
12 Turkey Dinner, Cooked, Frozen 4/4 Ib. pans/case 3 case |#47558 62.73
or approved equal
PUREED MEATS, INDIVIDUAL SERVINGS, PRE-
FORMED
Baked Fish, Frozen, 3 oz. portion, 24/3 oz. Thick and
13 servings/case 10 |case Easy#45926 24.10
or approved equal
Beef Patty, Sirloiner, Frozen, 3 oz. portion 24/3 oz Thick and
14 servings/case 13 |case | Easy#49846 24.10
or approved equal
Grillers, Hot Dogs, Frozen, 2 oz. portion, 24/2 oz. Thick and
15 servings/case 11 |case Easy#16323  20.00
or approved equal
Thick and
16 Ham, Frozen, 3 oz. portion, 24/3 oz. servings/case 14 |case Easy#25435 24.10
or approved equal
Thick and
17 Roast Beef, Frozen 3 oz. portion, 24/30z. Servings/case 18 |case Easy#10837 24.10
or approved equal
Roast Chicken, Frozen, 3 oz. portion, 24/3 oz. Thick and
18 servings/case 18 |case Easy#37954 24.10
or approved equal
Thick and
19 Roast Pork, Frozen, 3 oz. portion 24/3 oz. servings/case 14 |case Easy#38393 24.10
or approved equal
Roast Turkey, Frozen, 3 oz. portion, 24/3 oz. Thick and
20 servings/case 16 |case Easy#11505 24.33
or approved equal
Sausage Patty, Frozen 1 oz. portion, 90/1 oz. Thick and
21 serving/case 15 |case Easy#37334 23.10

or approved equal




PUREED MEATS, INDIVIDUAL SERVINGS, PRE-
FORMED

MFG Name
Description QTY Unit and Number Karetas
Thick and
22 Country Bread, 3 oz. portion 24/30z. Servings/case 0 case Easy No bid
or approved equal
Thick and
23 Turkey Dinner, 4 oz. portion 24/4 oz. servings/case 0 case Easy No bid
or approved equal
Savory Beef & Vegetables, 4 oz. portion, 24/ 40z. Thick and
24 Servings/case 0 case Easy No bid
or approved equal
Thick and
25 Garden Vegetable Medley Lasagna 4 oz. 24/case 2 case Easy No Award
or approved equal
Apple Cinnamon French Toast 3 oz. portion, 24/ 3 0z Thick and
26 servings/case 0 case Easy No bid
or approved equal
Breakfast Omelet, frozen, 2.5 oz.portion, 24/ 2.5 oz. Thick and
27 servings/case 18 |case | Easy#67010 19.97
or approved equal
Breakfast Sausage Links, Frozen 2.5 oz. portion, 24/2.5 Thick and
28 0z servings/case 16 |case Easy#67011 24.69
or approved equal
Breakfast Waffle, Frozen, 2.5 oz portion, 24/2.5 oz Thick and
29 servings/case 15 |case | Easy#67012 19.97

or approved equal













