
Bid# 7274- Opens: April 28, 2009
only accept 

approved brands

unapproved brand 
or missing brand 

information

Contract Period: June 1, 2009-Nov.30, 2009 lowest bid Vendor did not bid

Vendor Karetas Kast Harvin Valley Brook

Winning Bid 
Information

Vegetables

1 Asparagus Chopped Vendor Harvin

12/2 1/2 lb/cs 1.02 1.08 0.93 did not 0.93

Brand Packer Green Line Valley Fresh bid Valley Fresh

Packaging 6/2.5# 6/2.5# 6/2.5# on anything 6/2.5#

2 Beans Cut Wax " Cut Karetas

12/2 1/2 lb/cs 0.64 0.73 0.67 0.64

Brand Packer Green Line NonPareil Packer

Packaging 12/2# 12/2# 12/2.5# 12/2#

3 Beans Green French Cut Karetas

12/2 1/2 lb/cs 0.64 0.78 0.85 0.64

Brand Packer RP  Preferred The Inn Packer

Packaging 12/2# 12/2.5# 12/2# 12/2#

4 Beans Green Regular Harvin

20 lb bulk/cs 0.59 0.68 0.59 0.59

Brand Packer RP Preferred Nonpareil Nonpareil

Packaging 20# 20# 20# 20#

5 Beans Lima Fordhook Baby Lima Baby Lima Baby Lima Harvin

12/2 1/2 lb/cs 1.30 1.51 1.05 1.05

Brand Packer Green Line Nonpareil Nonpareil

Packaging 12/2 1/2 12/2.5 # 12/2.5# 12/2.5#

6 Broccoli Cut Harvin

12/2 lb/cs 0.62 0.66 0.61 0.61

Brand Packer Green Line Fine Line Fine Line

Packaging 12/2# 12/2.5 # 12/2# 12/2#



Vendor Karetas Kast Harvin Valley Brook
Winning Bid 
Information

7 Broccoli Spears Karetas

12/2 lb/cs 0.70 0.88 0.72 0.70

Brand Packer Packer Nonpareil Packer

Packaging 12/2 # 12/2.5 # 12/2# 12/2 #

8 Brussel Sprouts Harvin

12/2 lb/cs 0.88 0.90 0.79 0.79

Brand Packer Green Line Nonpareil Nonpareil

Packaging 12/2# 12/2 # 12/2# 12/2#

9 Broccoli Normandy 0.71 Kast .71

18 lb/cs 6/3 lb/cs 0.76 RP Preferred No Bid RP Preferred

Brand Packer Dutch/CA Blend Dutch/CA Blend

Packaging 12/2# 12/2 # 12/2 #

10 Carrots Whole Baby Karetas

20 lb/bulk 0.66 0.78 0.69 0.66

Brand Packer RP Preferred Valley Fresh Packer

Packaging 20# 20# 20# 20#

11 Cauliflower Harvin

12/2 lb/cs 0.71 0.78 0.64 0.64

Brand Packer Green Line Nonpareil Nonpareil

Packaging 12/2# 12/2# 12/2# 12/2#

12 Country Blend Vegetables Karetas

18 lb/cs 0.82 No Bid No Bid 0.82

Brand Packer Packer

Packaging 12/2# 12/2#

13 Kale Chopped Karetas

12/3 lb/cs 0.66 0.73 0.70 0.66

Brand Packer Seabrook Nonpareil Packer

Packaging 12/3# 12/3# 12/3# 12/3#



Vendor Karetas Kast Harvin Valley Brook
Winning Bid 
Information

14 Peas and Carrots Harvin

20 lb/bulk 0.65 0.66 0.63 0.63

Brand Packer RP Preferred Nonpareil Nonpareil

Packaging 20# 20# 12/2.5# 12/2.5#

15 Roman Mixed Vegetables

12/2 lb/cs

NO QUANTITIES

Packaging

16 Spinach Chopped 0.65 0.70 0.58 Harvin

12/3 lb/cs Packer Independent Regal 0.58

Brand 12/3# 12/3 # 12/3# Regal

Packaging 12/3#

17 Squash Hubbard Cooked Harvin

12/4 lb/cs 0.76 0.59 0.54 0.54

Brand Packer Krieder Farms Cope Label Cope Label

Packaging 12/4# 12/4# 12/4# 12/4#

18 Squash Yellow Sliced Harvin

12/3 lb/cs 0.72 0.81 0.68 0.68

Brand Packer Green Line Non Pareil Non Pareil

Packaging 12/2# 12/3# 12/3# 12/3#

19 Squash Zucchini Harvin

12/3 lb/cs 0.71 0.81 0.69 0.69

Brand Packer Green Line Non Pareil Non Pareil

Packaging 12/2# 12/3# 12/3# 12/3#

20 Succotash Harvin

12/2 1/2 lb/cs 0.89 0.85 0.84 0.84

Brand Packer RP Preferred Fine Line Fine Line

Package 12/2 1/2# 12/2.5 oz 12/2.5 oz 12/2.5 oz



Vendor Karetas Kast Harvin Valley Brook
Winning Bid 
Information

21 Snap Pea Blend Karetas

12 2/lb bag 24 lb/cs 0.95 No Bid No Bid 0.95

Brand Packer Packer

Packaging 12/2 # 12/2 #

22 Traditional Black-Eyed Peas

NO QUANTITIES

Brand

Packaging

Juice

23
Grapefruit Juice Portion Pack, Fresh 100% Pure, 
No sugar added. 

48/4 oz/cs Plastic Cup with aluminum peel off lid 
only

NO QUANTITIES

Packaging

24
Prune Juice Portion Pack, Fresh 100% Pure, No 
sugar added. 12.15/cs 14.62 19.75 Karetas

48/4 oz/cs Plastic Cup with aluminum peel off lid 
only Suncup Ocean Spray Fruit Bud 12.15/cs

Brand 72/4 oz 48/4 oz. 96/4 oz. Suncup

Packaging 72/4 oz

Fruit

25 Frozen Blueberries Kast

20 lb/cs 1.02 0.97 2.40 0.97

Brand Packer Packer Jewel Packer

Packaging 30# 30# 20# 30#



Vendor Karetas Kast Harvin Valley Brook
Winning Bid 
Information

26 Mixed Fruit Kast

20 lb/cs 1.73 1.15 No Bid 1.15

Brand Packer Green Line Green Line

Packaging 10# 20 # 20 #

Pastries

27 Puff Pastry Shell Karetas

120/cs 47.50 No Bid No Bid 47.50

Brand - Pepperidge Farm or Equal Packer Packer

Packaging 120/cs 120/cs

28 Pastry Puff Square Kast

5"x5" 96/cs 35.30 33.99 No Bid 33.99

Brand Packer Pennant Pennant

Packaging 120/ 5 x 5 120/ 2 oz 120/ 2 oz

29 Puff Pastry Sheet 35.30 No Bid Karetas

10x25 20sheets/cs Packer No Bid 35.30

Brand - Pepperidge Farm or Equal 20 ct 10x15 Packer

Packaging 20 ct 10x15

30 Croissants 28.38 No Bid NO AWARD

144/cs 35.90 Sara Lee CHEAPER

Brand - Sara Lee or Equal Awry's 4/12= 48 TO BUY OFF

Packaging 60/2.5 oz 48/2 oz CONTRACT

31 Pizza Cheese Individual Kast

96 15/oz/cs 61.00 44.99 51.50 44.99

Brand Tonys Schwans Nardones Schwans

Packaging 80/5 oz 96/ 4.56 oz. 96/5 oz 96/ 4.56 oz.



Vendor Karetas Kast Harvin Valley Brook
Winning Bid 
Information

32 Crescent Roll

NO QUANTITIES

Brand - Sara Lee or Equal

Packaging

33 Pizza Crust Square Karetas

Pre-bake 12 slices/sq. 96 5 1/2 oz 48.00 No Bid No Bid 48.00

Brand Nardone Nardone

Packaging 96 / 5 oz 96 / 5 oz

34 Breakfast Turkey Ham

21 lb/cs

NO QUANTITIES

Packaging

35 Stuffed Peppers Karetas

2/10 tray 48 portions/cs 39.80 54.13 No Bid 39.80

Brand Fairmont Stouffers Fairmont

Packaging 48 ct. 4/83 oz 48 ct.

36
Stuffed Shells filled w/100% Ricotta Cheese w/o 
sauce Kast

120/2 oz/cs 29.30 32.39 33.00 32.39

Brand Servioli Caesars Corsetti Caesars

Packaging 96/1.75 oz 96/2 oz 96/ 2 oz. 96/2 oz

Potatoes

37 Potato Puffs Oven Baked Harvin

6/5 lb 30 lb/cs 16.60 25.33 15.75 15.75

Brand Simplot Lamb Weston Harvest Harvest

Packaging 6/5# 6/5# 6/5# 6/5#



Vendor Karetas Kast Harvin Valley Brook
Winning Bid 
Information

38 Potatoes Herb Garlic Roasted Harvin

6/2 1/2 lb/cs 27.40 19.00 32.80 32.80

Brand Simplot Simplot Simplot

Packaging 6/4# 6/2.5# 6/5# 6/5#

39 Potatoes Rosemary Roasted Red Skin Kast

6 2 1/2 lb/cs 22.90 16.89 18.45 16.89

Brand Simplot Lamb Weston Simplot Lamb Weston

Packaging 6/2.5 6/2.5# 6/2.5# 6/2.5#

40 Meat Balls and Sauce Pre-cooked

54 ct/6 trays

NO QUANTITIES

Packaging

41 Breaded Country Syle Beef Steak Karetas

3 oz servings 20/box 18.70 No Bid NO Bid 18.70

Brand Lee Lee

Packaging 53/3 oz 53/3 oz

42 Vegetable Egg Roll No Meat Karetas

3 oz. 6/12 count 21.80 40.11 39.80 21.80

Brand Valdez Minn Minh Valdez

Packaging 50/3 oz 72/3 oz 72/3 oz 50/3 oz

43 Italian Cut Green Beans Karetas

12/2 lb/cs 24 lb/cs 0.74 0.76 0.75 0.74

Brand Packer Green Line The Inn Packer

Packaging 12/2# 12/2# 12/2# 12/2#

44 Chicken Fried Steak Karetas

Pre-cooked and oven bakable only 54.60 No Bid No Bid 54.60

Brand Pierre Pierre

Packaging 85/3.82 85/3.82



Vendor Karetas Kast Harvin Valley Brook
Winning Bid 
Information

45 Chicken Chow Mein Kast

4 trays per case only 38.40 37.69 No Bid 37.69

Brand La Choy La Choy La Choy

Packaging 4-4# 4/4# 4/4#

46 Collard Greens Harvin

Grade A 12/3 lb/cs 0.74 0.75 0.69 0.69

Brand Packer Green Line Non Pareil Non Pareil

Packaging 12/3# 6/3# 12/3# 12/3#

47 California Vegetable Blend RP Preferred Harvin

Grade A 1/30 lb/cs 0.78 0.69 0.69 0.69

Brand Packer Dutch Beans Non Pareil Non Pareil

Packaging 12/3# 20# 12/2# 12/2#

48 Chuckwagon Vegetable Blend Kast

Grade A 1/30 lb/cs 0.72 0.71 No Bid 0.71

Brand Packer RP Preferred RP Preferred

Packaging 12/3 # 20# 20#

49 Fajita Vegetable Blend Kast

Grade A Onion strip, Green pepper, Red Pepper and 
Yellow Pepper strips 6/4 lb/cs 0.86 0.75 1.96 0.75

Brand Packer Green Line Colony Lane Green Line

Packaging 12/3# 12/2# 8/1.25# 12/2#

50 Fried Okra Karetas

6/2 lb/cs 0.79 No Bid No Bid 0.79

Brand Packer Packer

Packaging 12/2# 12/2#

51 Okra Frozen-Cut Harvin

12/3 lb/cs 1.27 0.78 0.69 0.69

Brand Packer Green Line Non Pareil Non Pareil

Packaging 12/2# 12/2# 12/2# 12/2#



Vendor Karetas Kast Harvin Valley Brook
Winning Bid 
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52 Apple Cobbler Karetas

4/5# 29.50 30.96 No Bid 29.50

Brand Good Old Days Schwans Good Old Days

Packaging 4/5# 4/5# 4/5#

53 Peach Cobbler Karetas

4/5# 33.90 34.09 No Bid 33.90

Brand Good Old Days Schwans Good Old Days

Packaging 4/5# 4/5# 4/5#

54 Cheese Tortellini

3/3# 15.80 30.14 22.90 15.80

Brand Servioli Caesars Serveroli Servioli

Packaging 4/2.5# 10# 10# 10# 4/2.5# 10#

55 Mustard Greens Harvin

12/3 lb/cs 0.69 0.69 0.69 0.69

Brand Packer Green Line Non Pareil Non Pareil

Packaging 12/3 # 6/3# 12/3# 12/3#

56 Stuffed Cabbage Karetas

4/12 ea 49.90 66.57 No Bid 49.90

Brand Fairmont Stouffers Fairmont

Packaging 4/6# 4/92 oz. 4/6#


