DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
NUTRITIONALLY COMPLETE
FOODS
NESTLE /
NOVARTIS NUTRITION:
1-1
McKesson
Boost H.P. for all
24 8 0z. cans/case
#06753900 Chocolate Mck#3922600 case 31.32
#0675390 Vanilla Mck# 39222600 case 31.32
#06763800 Strawberry Mck#39232600 case 31.32
1-2 Sustacal Liquid
12 12 oz. cans/case ]
No Bids
#350-11 Chocolate case Purchase
Open
#351-11 Vanilla case | Market
1-3 Boost H.P.
6 32 0z. cans/case
No Bids
#0940-06 Chocolate Oven
Market
Purchase

#0941-06 Vanilla




Item DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PF
#
McKesson
1-4 Boost Regular for all
24 8 o0z. cans/case
#06743900 Vanilla  Mck#39212600 case 31.32
#06753900 Chocolate Mck#39222600 case 31.32
#06763800 Strawberry Mck#39232600 case 31.32
1-5
Boost with Fiber 24/8 oz./cans/cs.
#095104 Vanilla case No Bids
Purchase
#095202 Chocolate case Open
Market
#15770000-Orange Cream case
McKesson
1-6 Boost Pudding 48 5 o0z. cans/case for all
#0945-03 Vanilla Mck#4091-26-00 case 53.49
#0946-03 Chocolate Mck#4101-26-00 case 53.49
#0947-03 Butterscotch Mck#1501-26-00 case 53.49




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
McKesson
1-7 Boost Plus (HC) 24 8 oz. cans/case forall
#09313900 Vanilla Mck#38102600 case 33.07
#09323900 Chocolate Mck#38122600 case 33.07
#09333800 Strawberry Mck#38132600 case 33.07
1-8 Ultracal 24 8 o0z. cans/case
#4359-03 No Award
case Purchase
Open
Market
1-9 Ultracal 6 32 0z. cans/case No Award
Purchase
#4359-02 Vanilla case Open
Market
1-10 Ultracal- Ready to hang 1 liter 6/case No Award
Purchase
#59062600 case Open

market




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNITPRICE | TOTAL
PRICE
1-11 Isocal Liquid 12 12 oz. cans/case
No Award
#355-12 case Purchase
Open
Market
Isocal Liquid 24 8 oz. cans/case
1-12
#355-25
case No Award
Purchase
Open
Market
1-13 Isocal Liquid 6 32 0z. cans/case No Award
Purchase
#355-04 case Open
Market
1-14 Isocal Liquid 24 8 oz. btls./case No Award
Purchase
#356-11 case Open

Market




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
1-15 Isocal Liquid - Ready to hang No Award
1 Liter 6/case Purchase
Open
#355-06 case Market
1-16 Deliver 2.0, No Award
24 8 0z. cans/case Purchase
Open
Market
#0462-04 Vanilla case
1-17 Traumacal 24 8 o0z. cans/case No Award
Purchase
#0464-04 Vanilla case Open
Market
No Award
1-18 . Purchase
Criticare HN 24 8 oz. btls./case Open
case Market

#563-01




ltem # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY |UNIT |UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
No Award
1-19 Moducal Powder 6/13 oz. cans/case Purchase
Open
Market
#480-21 case
1-20 Casec Powder 6/10 oz. cans/case
No Award
#0390-10 case Purchase
Open
Market
1-21 MCT OQil 6/1 gt./btl./case
#365-13 Mck#3651-26-00 case 285.04
McKesson
1-22 Sustacal Instant Powder
4 X 1.9 0z. units- 9/units/case No Award
Purchase
#352-11 Chocolate- Discontinued case | Open
Market
#353-11 Vanilla -Discontinued case




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY [ UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
1-23 Boost Powder Hi-Protein No Bids
6/1 Ib./cans/case Purchase
Open
0943-03 Vanilla case Market
Pregestimil Powder 1 Ib./can/6/case
1-24
6721-2600 Mck#6721-2600
case 196.68
McKesson
1-25 Lipisorb Powder 6 1 Ib./cans/case No Bids
Purchase
#441-01 case | Open
Market
1-26 Lipisorb Liquid 24 8 o0z. cans/case No Award
Purchase
#0471-02 Vanilla case Open
Market
No Bids
Pro-Sobee, Concentrate Liquid Purchase
1-27 12/13 oz./case Open
Market

3811-2600




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
1-28 Respalor, 24/8 oz. cans/case No Bids
Purchase
Open
4403-2600 Vanilla case Market
1-29 Boost, 8 0z., 24/8 oz./cans/cs. McKesson
for all
#06743900 Vanilla Mck#39212600 31.32
#06753900 Chocolate Mck#39222600 31.32
1-30 Kindercal, 8 oz., w/Fiber
24/8 0z./cans/cs.
9401-2600 Vanilla w/ Fiber Tube case 47.41
Feeding Isotonic
47.41
6100-2600 Vanilla w/Fiber case
McKesson
for both
No Bids
1-31 Purchase
Choice dm, 8 oz. Open
24/ 8 0z. cans/case Market
#16950200 Vanilla case




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
1-32 Choice dm, Ready to Hang No Award
1 liter, 6/case Purchase
Open
Market
#06960100 Vanilla case
1-33 COMPLY, 24/8 oz./cans/case No Award
#00890400 Purchase
case Open
Market
No Award
1-34 COMPLY, 6/1 Liter/case Purchase
#008902 Open
Market
case
No Award
1-35 MAGNACAL RENAL, Purchase
24/8 0z., Cans/case Open
Market

#00400200

case




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
1-36 MICROLIPID, 48/3 oz. Bottle/case
#00870200 Mck# 8702-26-00
case 124.63
McKesson
No Award
1-37 PROTAIN XL. 24/8 oz. cans/case Purchase
Open
#00880400 Market
case
No Award
1-38 PROTAIN XL, 6/1 liter/case Purchase
Open
#00880200 Market

case




DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNITPRICE | TOTAL
Iltem # PRICE
1-39 Citrotein 12/14.16 oz. cans/case
Orange case | No Bids
Purchase
Grape case Open
Punch  1702-26-00 cage | Market
1-40 Compleat B No Bids
24/250 ml. cans/case case Purchase
Open
Market
1-41 Compleat Modified Formula
24/250 ml. cans/case #140100 case 63.44
Mck# 2251-26-00
McKesson
1-42 Resource Liquid 27/8 fl. oz.
brik paks/case
Chocolate 337200 case No Award
Purchase
Vanilla 337100 case Open
Market
Strawberry 337300 case




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
1-43
Resource Plus Liquid 27/8 fl. oz.
brik paks case
Chocolate  #338200
case | No Award
Vanilla #338100 Purchase
case Open
Strawberry  #338300 Market
case
1-44 Resource 27/8 fl. oz.
brik pak case
Fruit Beverage 18620000
Mck# 6200-26-00 case 31.34
McKesson
1-45 InsoSource 27 x 8 ounce No Bids
brik pak case case Purchase
Open
Market
1-46 IsoSource
8 0z. , 24/case
#184500
Mck# 18452600 case 22.89

McKesson




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
1-47 IsoSource HN 24/250 ml. cans/case
brik pak —  #184500
Mck# 1845-26-00 22.89
McKesson
FiberSource 8 0z cans/24case
#185500
1-48 Mck#18552600
case 24.13
McKesson
FiberSource HN 24/250 ml. cans/case
1-49 #185500
Mck# 18552600 case 24.13

McKesson




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE | TOTAL
PRICE
1-50 Citrotein 72/1.57 oz. pkts./case
Orange 15930-6200-26-00 case 3134
McKesson
1-51 Impact 24/250 ml. cans/case #358100
Mck#3581-26-00 case 166.18
McKesson
1-52 Impact (Closed System) 6 x 1 liter/case No Bids
Purchase
#358101 case Open
Market
1-53 Impact with Fiber 24/250 ml./cans/case
#358700  Mck#3587-26-00 case | 169.41
McKesson
1-54 Compleat B (Closed System)
1000 ml. rth 6/case
#141401
Mck# 14012600 case 73.15

McKesson




DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
Iltem # PRICE PRICE
Compleat, 1500 ml. rth, 6/case
1-55
141420 Mck#14202600
case 104.49
McKesson
1-56 Compleat Modified (Closed System)
6 x 1 Liter Containers
#14140100 Mck#14012600 case 73.15
McKesson
1-57 Compleat 6 x 1.5 Liter
#14142000 case 104.49
Mck# 14202600
McKesson
1-58
IsoSource (Closed System)
1000 ml. rth 6/case
#184601
Mck# 46012600 case 29.11
McKesson
1-59 IsoSource 1500 ml. rth 6/case
#184620 Mck#46202600 case 43.66

McKesson




Iltem # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
IsoSource HN (Closed System)
1-60 6 x 1 Liter Container
#184601 Mck#46012600 29.11
McKesson
1-61 IsoSource
1500 ml. rth, 6/case
#184620 case 43.66
Mck# 46202600
McKesson
FiberSource HN
1-62 1000 ml. rth, 6/case
185201
Mck# 52012600 case 30.35
McKesson
FiberSource HN, 1500 ml. rth, 6/case
185220
Mck# 52202600
1-63 45.52

McKesson




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
1-64 FiberSource HN (Closed System)
6 x 1 Liter Container
#185201 Mck#5201-2600 case 30.35
McKesson
1-65 FiberSource HN 6 x 1.5 Liter
#185220 Mck#5220-26-00 case 45.52

McKesson




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
COMPAT ENTERNAL FEEDING
1-66 SYSTEM
Compat 500 ml. container w/ pre-attached
Gravity Delivery, (Set) 30 sets/case case | 79.80
#19921600 Mck#9216-4600
Compat 1000 ml. container w/pre-attached case | NoBid
Gravity Delivery (Set) 30 sets/case
#1992110
Compat 500 ml. w/pre-attached pump, case | 117.00
Delivery (Set) 30 sets/case
#19931200 Mck#931246-00
Compat 1000 ml. container w/pre-attached
pump. Delivery (Set) 30 sets/case case | 123.00
#19931300 Mck#9313-46-00
Compat Enternal Delivery Pump
#19923500 Mck#9235-46-00 each 133689
***AWARD AS A GROUP***
McKesson
for all
1-67 Pump Delivery Set w/Piercing Spike
30 sets/case
#199507
9507-4600 case 71.10

McKesson




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
1-68
BIOSYSTEMS
GASTROSTOMY TUBE SYSTEM
Clear Silicone Replacement Balloon
Gastrostomy Tubes, 5/case
case 139.75
16 French Mck#7516-46-00
case 13.975
18 French  Mck#7518-46-00
case 13.975
20 French  Mck#7520-46-00
case 130.7
22 French  Mck#7522-46-00 19.5
McKesson
for all
LOW PROFILE REPLACEMENT
GASTROSTOMY TUBE (GASTRO-
PORT) 1 per case
#087606 22 French Short Length (1.6cm) case
No Bids
#087601 22 French Medium Length case Purchase
(2.7cm) Open
Market
#087602 22 French Long Length (4.3cm) case
#087603 28 French Medium Length case )
(2.7cm) No Bids
Purchase
#087604 French Long Length (4.3 cm) case Open
Market

*x* AWARD AS GROUP***




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
1-69 BIOSYSTEMS NASOGASTRIC
FEEDING TUBES
8 FR 42" Length polyurethane,
radiopague tube with Y adapter, weighted
bolus, stylet free 10 per case case No Bids
#083104 Purchase
Open
12 FR 42" Length polyurethane, Market
radiopaque tube with Y adapter, weighted case
bolus, stylet free, 10 per case.
#31024600
12 FR (Same as above except has a flow case
thru bolus) 10 per case #31034600 No Bids
8 French NG Tube (Same as above except Ccase Purchase
. Open
contains a pre-assembled stylet) 10 per Market
case. #31404600 —_
12 French NG Tube (Same as above
except contains a assembled stylet) case
10 per case #3105600
***AWARD AS A GROUP***
1-70
Tolerex 120 x 2.82 oz./pkts./cs.
#04580500
Mck#1207-26-00 case 811.40

McKesson




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
1-71 Vivonex T.E.N. 120 x 2.82 oz.
#071298 Mck#1298-26-00 case 907.60
McKesson
1-72 NESTLE
Glytrol
Vanilla 250 ml can, 24/case
Kosher, lactose and gluten free
moderate caloric density
#63752600 case | 45.52

McKesson




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
ABBOTT NUTRITION
21 Ensure Liquid, 24/8 oz. cans/case
#50462 Chocolate case 10.90
#51738 Coffee case 10.90
#50648 Strawberry case 10.90
#50460 Vanilla case 10.90
#51892 Butter Pecan case 10.90
Abbott
Nutrition
for all
2-2 Ensure, Liquid, 6/32 oz./case
#733 Vanilla case No Bid
Purchase
#799 Chocolate case | Open Market




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
2-3 Ensure Plus, Liquid, 24/8 oz./cans/case
#50466 Chocolate case 11.90
#50464 Vanilla case 11.90
#51740 Coffee case 11.90
#50646 Strawberry case 11.90
#51894 Butter Pecan case 11.90
Abbott
Nutrition
for all
2-4 Osmolite, 24/8 oz. btls./case
#715 Case | NoBid
Purchase
Open
market
2-5 Osmolite, 24/8 oz. cans/case
#709 case No Bid
Purchase
Open
market
2-6 Osmolite, 6/32 0z. cans/case
#738 case No Bid
Purchase

Open Market




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
2-7 Isomil, 24/13 oz. cans/case
#2110 case 100.56
Abbott
Nutrition
2-8 Gravity Feeding Sets, 24/case
#061 case 57.13
Abbott
Nutrition
2-9 GLUCERNA, 24/8 oz., cans/case
#50240 Vanilla case 25.25
Abbott
Nutrition
2-10
Osomlite HN PLUS, 24/80z. cans/case
#53120 Vanilla case 13.32
Abbott
Nutrition
2-11 Jevity Plus, 24/8 oz. cans/case
#53118 1.2 cal case 19.57
#57333 1.5 cal case 20.64




Iltem # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
2-12 Ensure Plus HN 24/8 oz. cans/case
#721 Vanilla case No Bid
#631 Chocolate case No Bid
Osmolite 1.5 24/ 8 oz. cans/cs. #57469 case 14.17
Abbott
Nutrition
2-13 Osmolite HN 24/8 oz. cans/case
#735 case 11.09
Abbott
Nutrition
2-14 Osmolite HN 24/8 oz. btls./case
#736 case No Bid
Purchase
Open
Market
2-15 Osmolite HN 6/32 o0z. cans/case
7390-2600 case No Bid
Purchase
Open

market




DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
Item #
2-16 Polycose Powder 6/12.3 0z. cans/case
#746 case 23.69
Abbott
Nurtition
2-18 Vital 24/2.79 oz. packets/case
#766 case 89.25
Abbott
Nutrition
2-19 Ensure Pudding, 48/5 oz. cans/case
#54846 Chocolate case 24.28
#54844  Vanilla case 24.28
#54848 Butterscotch case 24.28
Abbott
Nutrition
2-20 Two-Cal, HN 24/8 oz. cans/case
#729  Vanilla case 18.95
#54064 Butter Pecan case 18.95
Abbott
Nutrition

for all




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
2-21 Pulmocare, 24/8 oz. cans/case
#699 Vanilla case 24.43
#50180 Strawberry case 24.43
Abbott
Nutrition
for all
2-22 Ensure with Fiber 24/8 oz. cans/case
#55314 Chocolate
case 14.27
#50650 Vanilla case 14.27
Abbott
Nutrition
for all
2-23 Ensure Powder, 6/14 oz./case
#750 Vanilla case 25.11
Abbott
Nutrition
2-26 Jevity 24/8 oz. cans/case
#143 Case 16.60
Abbott

Nutrition




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
2-27 Pediasure 24/8 oz. cans/case
Vanilla #55897 case 23.69
Chocolate #51882 case 23.69
Strawberry #51880 case 23.69
Banana Cream #51884 case 23.69
Orange Cream #57841 case 23.69
Abbott
Nutrition
for all
2-28 Pediasure with Fiber 8 oz./cans/24/case
58220 Vanilla case 28.43
Abbott
Nutrition
Abbott
2-29 Flexiflo Easy Feed Enternal Nutrition Bag Nutrition
w/pre-attached gravity feeding set.
30/ sets/ case
#00056 case 60.85
2-30 Flexiflo Top Fill Bag w/pre-attached
flexiflo campion pump set. 30/case
#00071 case 125.19
Abbott

Nutrition




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
Abbott
2-31 Quantum Top Fill and Flush Nutrition
30/case
#50606
case 163.11
2-32 Quantum Spike Set with Flush Abbott
30/case Nutrition
#50604
case 131.55
2-33 Piston Syringe 60cc 100/case
#56014600
Mck# 5601-46-00
case 82.00
McKesson
Abbott
Nutrition
2-34 Ensure Plus 6/32 oz. Bottles/case for both
#58251 Vanilla case
14.59
#58262 Chocolate case
14.59
#51172 Strawberry case

No Bid




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
2-35 Suplena, Liquid 24/8 oz. cans/case
#59664 case 47.79
Abbott
Nutrition
2-36 Promote, Liquid 24/8 oz. cans/case
#50774- Vanilla case 17.19
Abbott
Nutrition
2-37 Flexiflo Toptainer w/pre-attached pump set
30/case
#494 case No Bid
Open
Market
Ensure with Fiber Liquid, 8 0z./ 24 case
2-38
Vanilla #50650 case 14.27
Chocolate #55314 case 14.27
Abbott
Nutrition

for all




Iltem # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
2-39 Jevity, Liquid, 6/32 oz./case
#50330 case No Bids
Open
market
2-40 Perative, Liquid 24/8 oz./can/case
#50628 case 45.48
Abbott
Nutrition
2-41 Perative Ready to Hang
8/1000 ml. units/case
#51948 case 64.44
Abbott

Nutrition




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
2-42 Stomate Low Profile Gastrostomy Device
All Sizes
#50080- Short 22F each
No Bids
#50090 - Medium 22F each Open
Market
#50100 - Long 22F each for all of
these
#50072 - X-tra Short 18F each items
#50082 - Short 18F each
#50092 - Medium 18F each
#50102 - Large 18F each
2-43 Easy Feed Gastrostomy Tubes
#50112-16F each 19.14
#50114 - 18F gach 19.14
#50116 - 20F each 19.14
#50118- 22F gach 19.14
Abbott
Nutrition

for all




Iltem # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
2-44 Flexflo Gastrostomy Tubes
#152-14F each No Bids
Purchase
#153-16F each Open
Market
#154-18F each on all of
these
#155- 20F each items
#156-22F each
#159-24F each
#50158 - 26F each
2-45 Ross Flexi-Flow
Magna Port Gastrostomy Tube 1/case
#51358-14 French each 23.00
#51360-16 French each 23.00
#51362-18 French each 23.00
#51364-20 French each 23.00
#51366-22 French each 23.00
#54738-24 French each 23.00
#59472-26 French each 23.00
Abbott
Nutrition

for all




ltem # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY |UNIT [UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
2-46 Ross Pre-Filled System 8
1000 ml. units/case Liquid
#00682 Jevity case 28.91
#53124 Jevity Plus case 33.19
#50350 Osmolite case No Bid
#53122 Osmolite HN Plus case 27.56
#668 Osmolite case 23.13
#669 Introlite case No Bid
#681 Ensure Plus HN case No Bid
#50340 Ensure Plus case No Bid
#51204 Pulmocare case 52.59
#51206 Glucerna case 37.50
#51616 Promote case 29.93
#51402 Equalite case No Bid
#51874 Promote w/Fiber case 29.93
#57471 Osmolite 1.5 case 31.27
#53536 Glucerna 1.5 case 67.50
#57329 Jevity 1.5 case 35.02
#59677 Nepro case 77.95
#57047 Two Cal HN case 32.87
Abbott
Nutrition

for all




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT |UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
2-47
Ross, Pre-Filled System 6
1500 ml. units/case Liquid
#52604 Jevity case 35.78
#53114 Jevity Plus case 32.66
#52600 Osmolite HN case 28.62
#53116 Osmolite HN Plus case 34.11
#52602 Glucerna case 46.41
#57633 Promote w/Fiber case 37.04
#57331 Jevity 1.5 case | 34.46
#57635 Perative case 72.50
#57631 Promote case 33.68
Abbott
Nutrition
for all
2-48 Advera Liquid, 24/8 oz./case
#51304 Chocolate case No Bids
#52452 Vanilla case Open

Market




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNITPRICE | TOTAL
PRICE
2-49 Equalite, 8 liters/case
#51666 case No Bids
Open Market
2-50 Nepro Liquid, 24/8 oz./case
#59666- Vanilla case 44.41
#59660- Butter Pecan case 44.41
#59662- Berry case 4441
Abbott
Nutrition
for all
2-51 Promote with Fiber 24/8 oz./case
#51872 case 17.19
Abbott
Nutrition
2-52 Promod 6/32 o0z. cans/case
#59721 case 108.96
Abbott

Nutrition




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
2-53 Ensure high Protein 24/8 oz. cans/case
(not to be confused with HN)
#52104 Wild Berry case | 11.50
#52100 Vanilla case | 11.50
#52098 Chocolate case 11.50
Abbott
Nutrition for
all
2-54 CHOCOLATE GLUCERNA BARS
4/pk- 6 pk/cs. #56957
case 25.68
Abbott
Nutrition
LEMON GLUCERNA BARS
4/pk-6 pki/cs.
2-55 #57011 case No Bid
GLUCERNA MINI SNACK BAR
Oatmeal Raisin, #59704
2-56 8 bars/carton, 6 cartons/case case 30.24
Abbott

Nutrition




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
GLUCERNA MINI SNACK BAR
Chocolate Peanut #59708
2-57 8 bars/carton 6 cartons/cae case 30.24
Abbott
Nutrition
2-58
JUVEN- Therapeutic Nutritional Drink
Mix, .81 oz. (23 g) packets,
Orange #57935- 6 Carton case (180
packets) case 383.04
Grape # 57936- 6 Carton case (180
packets) case 383.04
Orange #58012- 1 Carton case (30 case 68.88
packets)
Grape #58011- 1 Carton case (30 packets) case 68.88
Abbott
Nutrition

for all




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
GLUCERNA SELECT- Glycemic control,
2-59 high protein, 8 oz cans, 24/case
Vanilla #57701
case 34.93
1000 ml. pre-filled containers- Ready to
Hang #57703
case 65.29
1500 ml. pre-filled containers- Ready
to Hang #57705
case 73.46
Abbott
Nutrition
for all
2-60
GLUCERNA SHAKE, 8 oz. cans/24/case
Vanilla #54328 case 22.00
Chocolate #54544 case 22.00
Strawberry # 56052 case 22.00
Butter Pecan #54326 case 22.00
Abbott
Nutrition

for all




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
2-61 PIVOT 1.5 - High Protein with Arginine
1000 ml. pre-filled containers, Ready case 171.04
to Hang 8/case #58015
1500 m. pre-filled containters, Ready
to Hang 6/case #58015 case No Bid
8 0z. cans, 24/case #58013 118.78
Abbott
Nutrition
for all
2-62 HI-CAL VANILLA, 8/case
2 Cal/ml, 1 Liter, Reclosable Plastic
Bottle, #58253 26.70
Abbott
Nutrition
2-63 GLUCERNA, 1.2 CAL
8 0z., 24/case #50904 case 33.60
1 Liter, 8/case # 50906 case 54.00
1.5 Liter, 6/case #50902 case 66.83
Glucerna 1.5 Cal, 24/8 oz cans/case case 42.00
#53534
Abbott
Nutrition

for all




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
2-64 Enlive
Apple, 27/8 oz/case, #54775 case 26.46
Mixed Berry, 27/ 8 oz/case #53462 case 26.46
Abbott
Nutrition

for all




Item # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT | UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
CARBOTROL FOODS
3-1 Fruit Sauce (pureed), 68 ozs. Plastic Tubs
6 per case
Apricot case
Fruit Cocktail case | No Bids
Purchase
Peach case Open
Market
Pears Case
Pineapple case
3-2 Fruit Cups, Diced, 4.0 0z./72 per case
Peach case No Bids
Purchase
Pears case Open
Market
Mixed case







